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Lake + Land Studio, LLC

first floor conditioned
2,806 sq ft

second floor conditioned
842 sq ft

total conditioned
3,648 sq ft

first floor under roof
3,549 sq ft

second floor under roof
989 sq ft

total under roof
4,538 sq ft

The Sarasota Residence is 
accentuated by the natural 
light that pours into its 
vaulted great room. This 
design is abundant with 
components that make 
the Sarasota one of a 
kind!  As one enters the 
residence, they spill into a 
gallery, perfect to exhibit 
those special art pieces. 
An especially functional 
scullery kitchen provides 
additional back of house 
support to make any 
gathering a piece of cake! 
The great room and kitchen 
flaunt beautiful exposed 
beams that draw your eyes 
to both the screened porch 
and great room fireplace.

Sarasota
Residence

overall width
84’ - 6”

overall depth
43’ - 6”

Breakfast Room

3 1/2 Bath 3 Bedroom2 Story

Office

Screened Porch

Scullery KitchenElevator

Office/Craft Space
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